

PRELIMINARY RESULTS BC #20017 - PRINTING SERVICES OPEN: 5/29/2020 11:00AM		American Envelope 612 East Elizabeth Ave Linden, NJ 07036		Ascot Tag & Label Company 577 North 3rd Street Newark, NJ 07107		TC Squared, LLC dba Centurion Printing 352 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033		Concept Print 40 Lydecker Street Nyack, NY 10960		Courier Printing Corporation 24 Laurel Bank Ave #1 Deposit, NY 13764		Morgan Printing 333 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Premier Printing Solutions 513 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Tpk Ridgewood, NJ 07450	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE		
TYPESETTING CHARGES			ONE TIME FEE		ONE TIME FEE		ONE TIME FEE		ONE TIME FEE		ONE TIME FEE		ONE TIME FEE		ONE TIME FEE		
1	One time fee, per page (1/4 page or less of revisions)	1	\$25.00	1	\$60.00	1	NO BID	1	\$15.00	1	INCLUDED	1	\$20.00	1	\$15.00	1	\$20.00
2	One time fee, per page (1/3 page or less of revisions)	2	\$35.00	2	\$75.00	2	NO BID	2	\$20.00	2	INCLUDED	2	\$20.00	2	\$20.00	2	\$20.00
3	One time fee, per page (1/2 page or less of revisions)	3	\$45.00	3	\$100.00	3	NO BID	3	\$25.00	3	INCLUDED	3	\$20.00	3	\$25.00	3	\$25.00
4	One time fee, per page (full page revisions)	4	\$60.00	4	\$150.00	4	NO BID	4	\$40.00	4	INCLUDED	4	\$30.00	4	\$40.00	4	\$50.00
LETTERHEAD & ENVELOPES			PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
5	Letterhead, 8 1/2" x 11", White, Certificate Bond, 1-color Ink (Ordered in increments of 1,000 per department)	5	\$107.00	5	\$187.50	5	\$41.95	5	\$75.00	5	NO BID	5	\$80.00	5	\$54.00	5	\$42.00
6	Letterhead, 8 1/2" x 11", Ivory Classic Linen, 2-color Ink (Ordered in increments of 1,000 per department)	6	\$132.00	6	\$256.25	6	\$70.00	6	\$120.00	6	NO BID	6	\$80.00	6	\$97.00	6	\$68.50
7	Department Address Envelopes, #10, White, 1-color Ink, No Window (Ordered in increments of 1,000 per department)	7	\$60.00	7	\$107.51	7	\$25.85	7	\$35.00	7	\$111.00	7	\$90.00	7	\$48.00	7	\$23.95
8	Department Address Envelopes, #10, White, 1-color Ink, Left Window (Ordered in increments of 1,000 per department)	8	\$70.00	8	\$108.88	8	\$27.85	8	\$40.00	8	\$116.00	8	\$95.00	8	\$49.00	8	\$25.97
9	Department Address Envelopes (Municipal Court), Security Tint, #10, White, 1-color Ink (Blue), Left Window (Ordered in increments of 1,000)	9	\$72.00	9	\$194.38	9	\$27.95	9	\$50.00	9	\$119.00	9	\$105.00	9	\$56.00	9	\$56.00
10	Department Address Envelopes, #10, White, 1-color Ink, Left Window "TAX BILL ENCLOSED" printed on envelope (Ordered in increments of 1,000)	10	\$50.00	10	\$108.88	10	\$27.95	10	\$40.00	10	\$116.00	10	\$40.00	10	\$49.00	10	\$25.97
11	Department Address Envelopes, #10, Ivory Classic Linen, 2-color Ink, No Window (Ordered in increments of 1,000 per department)	11	\$95.00	11	\$265.01	11	\$138.00	11	\$140.00	11	NO BID	11	\$150.00	11	\$125.00	11	\$147.00
BUSINESS CARDS			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
12	Business Cards, Ivory Stock, Blue Ink, 3 1/2" x 2" (Ordered in increments of 500 per person)	12	\$50.00	12	\$81.25	12	\$38.90	12	\$38.50	12	NO BID	12	\$30.00	12	\$39.00	12	\$38.95
13	Business Cards, Ivory Stock, Blue & Green Ink, 3 1/2" x 2" (Ordered in increments of 500 per person)	13	\$70.00	13	\$106.25	13	\$42.00	13	\$42.50	13	NO BID	13	\$30.00	13	\$42.00	13	\$70.00
PURCHASING			PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
14	Storeroom Request, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, Numbered in Red, 5 1/2" x 8 1/2"	14	\$105.00	14	\$236.62	14	\$129.00	14	\$150.00	14	\$242.00	14	\$175.00	14	\$117.00	14	\$117.00
15	Central Receiving Form, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	15	\$150.00	15	\$247.15	15	\$129.00	15	\$140.00	15	\$340.00	15	\$235.00	15	\$129.00	15	\$119.00
16	Manual Requisition, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, Numbered in Red, 8 1/2" x 11"	16	\$112.00	16	\$207.12	16	\$119.00	16	\$185.00	16	\$242.00	16	\$260.00	16	\$136.00	16	\$192.00
17	Bid Envelope, White, Black Ink, Fold on Left Side, 13" x 10"	17	\$138.00	17	\$275.32	17	\$140.00	17	\$140.00	17	\$268.00	17	\$145.00	17	\$129.00	17	\$109.00
MAYOR			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
18	Proclamation Paper, Ivory Classic Linen, Ink Color TBD, 8 1/2" x 14"	18	\$195.00	18	\$200.00	18	\$149.00	18	\$145.00	18	NO BID	18	\$225.00	18	\$119.00	18	\$119.00

PRELIMINARY RESULTS BC #20017 - PRINTING SERVICES OPEN: 5/29/2020 11:00AM		American Envelope 612 East Elizabeth Ave Linden, NJ 07036		Ascot Tag & Label Company 577 North 3rd Street Newark, NJ 07107		TC Squared, LLC dba Centurion Printing 352 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033		Concept Print 40 Lydecker Street Nyack, NY 10960		Courier Printing Corporation 24 Laurel Bank Ave #1 Deposit, NY 13764		Morgan Printing 333 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Premier Printing Solutions 513 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Tpk Ridgewood, NJ 07450	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE		
FINANCE			PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		PRICE PER 1,000 SETS		
19	Purchase Order, 5-Part NCR, Not Bound, Black Ink w/ Shaded Areas as Indicated, 8 1/2" x 11", For use in HP LaserJet Enterprise M609 Printer Page Order From Top to Bottom (with pages face up): - White - Vendor Copy (with yellow highlighted area) - 2 sided - White - Vendor Copy - 2 sided - Yellow - Purchasing Copy - 1 sided - Gold - File Copy - 1 sided - Pink - Finance Copy - 1 sided	19	\$263.00	19	NO BID	19	\$599.40	19	\$395.00	19	NO BID	19	\$340.00	19	\$666.00	19	NO BID
TAX COLLECTOR			PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
20	Receipt for Taxes, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 4 1/4" x 2 3/4"	20	\$45.00	20	\$162.50	20	\$28.00	20	\$55.00	20	NO BID	20	\$65.00	20	\$43.00	20	\$26.00
21	Delinquent Notices, Computer Form, Blank, White Card Stock, Perforated for 4 Receipts, Total Size 8 1/2" x 11", Each Receipt Size 4 1/4" x 5 1/2"	21	\$98.00	21	\$146.10	21	\$95.00	21	\$90.00	21	NO BID	21	\$40.00	21	\$56.00	21	\$33.00
22	Official Search for Municipal Liens, Computer Fed, Blue Ink, 2-Part NCR, Shaded Areas, 9 1/2" x 14"	22	\$305.00	22	\$325.90	22	\$340.00	22	\$295.00	22	NO BID	22	\$420.00	22	NO BID	22	\$319.00
23	Certificate of Sale, Laser Form, 1st Page White, 2nd Page Yellow, 2nd Page Different Information, 2-Sided, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11", 2-Hole Punch on the Bottom	23	\$117.00	23	\$283.75	23	\$362.00	23	\$205.00	23	NO BID	23	\$195.00	23	\$199.00	23	\$195.00
24	Tax Title Lien, Black Ink, 2-Sided, 2-Hole Punch on Left Side, 12" x 8 1/4"	24	\$99.00	24	\$156.25	24	\$104.50	24	\$125.00	24	NO BID	24	\$100.00	24	NO BID	24	\$103.00
25	Address/Mortgage Change Form, Black Ink, White Certificate Bond, 3 1/2" x 7"	25	\$55.00	25	\$81.25	25	\$40.00	25	\$45.00	25	NO BID	25	\$25.00	25	\$42.00	25	\$39.95
SENIOR SERVICES			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
26	Driver's Vehicle Inspection Report with Illustrations, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, Three Hole Punch on Left Side, Bound on Top with Perforated Line Under, 8 1/2" x 11"	26	\$152.00	26	\$219.41	26	\$139.00	26	\$125.00	26	NO BID	26	\$150.00	26	NO BID	26	\$139.00
RECREATION			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
27	Softball Site Supervisor Report, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	27	\$75.00	27	\$179.22	27	\$62.00	27	\$85.00	27	\$143.00	27	\$60.00	27	\$61.00	27	\$61.90
28	Basketball Site Supervisor Report, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	28	\$75.00	28	\$179.22	28	\$62.00	28	\$85.00	28	\$143.00	28	\$60.00	28	\$61.00	28	\$61.90
29	Basketball Umpire Timesheet, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	29	\$75.00	29	\$179.22	29	\$62.00	29	\$85.00	29	\$143.00	29	\$60.00	29	\$61.00	29	\$61.90
30	Fall Fest Cards, 100# Coated Cover, 2-Sided, 4/4 Process, 4" x 9"	30	\$65.00	30	\$256.25	30	\$139.00	30	\$75.00	30	\$417.00	30	\$110.00	30	NO BID	30	\$70.50
RECREATION			PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
31	Farmers Market Handout, Gloss Coated, 2-Sided, 6" x 11", Full Color on Front, UV Coated	31	\$154.00	31	\$275.00	31	\$419.00	31	\$115.00	31	NO BID	31	\$125.00	31	NO BID	31	\$284.25
RECREATION			PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED
32	Record of Daily Cash Receipts, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 3 Receipts/Page, 99 Receipts/Booklet, Booklet Bound on Left with Fold Over Flap, 8 1/2" x 11"	32	\$8.85 / bkl.	32	\$333.25 /25 bklt.	32	\$25.50 / bkl.	32	\$30.00 / bkl.	32	NO BID	32	\$9.50 / bkl.	32	NO BID	32	NO BID
33	Swim Team Pads, White Paper, Black Ink, Glued on Top, 3 1/2" x 5", 100 Sheets per Pad	33	\$2.15 / pad	33	\$56.87 / pad	33	\$0.89 / pad	33	\$7.50 / pad	33	NO BID	33	\$1.40 / pad	33	\$1.35 / pad	33	NO BID
34	Marina Receipt Booklet, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 3 Receipts/Page, 99 Receipts/Booklet, Bound on Left with Fold Over Flap, 8 1/2" x 11"	34	\$32.00 / bkl.	34	\$487.37 /5 bklt.	34	\$28.75 / bkl.	34	\$50.00 / bkl.	34	NO BID	34	\$12.00 / bkl.	34	NO BID	34	NO BID
35	Marina Contract Forms, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	35	\$79.00 / 200	35	\$241.73 / 200	35	\$73.00 / 200	35	\$95.00 / 200	35	NO BID	35	\$70.00 / 200	35	\$69.00 / 200	35	NO BID

PRELIMINARY RESULTS BC #20017 - PRINTING SERVICES OPEN: 5/29/2020 11:00AM		American Envelope 612 East Elizabeth Ave Linden, NJ 07036		Ascot Tag & Label Company 577 North 3rd Street Newark, NJ 07107		TC Squared, LLC dba Centurion Printing 352 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033		Concept Print 40 Lydecker Street Nyack, NY 10960		Courier Printing Corporation 24 Laurel Bank Ave #1 Deposit, NY 13764		Morgan Printing 333 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Premier Printing Solutions 513 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Tpk Ridgewood, NJ 07450	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE
TOWNSHIP CLERK			PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED		PRICE PER AS INDICATED
36	General Vendor License, Black Ink, Off White Paper Stock, 10 1/4" x 6"	36	\$65.00 / 100	36	\$75.00 / 100	36	\$28.50 / 100	36	\$35.00 / 100	36	NO BID	36	\$25.00 / 100	36	\$30.00 / 100	36	\$28.00 / 100
37	Taxi Driver License, Index Card Stock, Color TBD, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 5 1/2"	37	\$55.00 / 100	37	\$75.00 / 100	37	\$20.00 / 100	37	\$35.00 / 100	37	NO BID	37	\$25.00 / 100	37	\$32.00 / 100	37	\$19.90 / 100
38	Solicitor's Permit, Blue Card, Black Ink, 4" x 2 1/2"	38	\$40.00 / 50	38	\$81.25 / 50	38	\$17.00 / 50	38	\$60.00 / 50	38	NO BID	38	\$15.00 / 50	38	\$19.00 / 50	38	\$24.00 / 50
39	Solicitor's Permit, Yellow Card, Black Ink, 4" x 2 1/2"	39	\$45.00 / 100	39	\$81.25 / 100	39	\$17.00 / 100	39	\$30.00 / 100	39	NO BID	39	\$20.00 / 100	39	\$25.00 / 100	39	\$24.00 / 100
40	Petty Cash Receipts, Goldenrod, Black Ink, 100 Sheets per Pad, 4 1/4" x 3 1/2"	40	\$5.50 / pad	40	\$56.87 / pad	40	\$4.90 / pad	40	\$10.00 / pad	40	NO BID	40	\$20.00 / pad	40	\$5.00 / pad	40	\$4.79 / pad
TOWNSHIP CLERK			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
41	Address Labels, 4" x 3", Blue Ink, Printed on Rolls, 500 per roll	41	\$108.00	41	\$173.75	41	\$205.00	41	\$85.00	41	NO BID	41	\$210.00	41	NO BID	41	NO BID
42	Animal Licenses, Blue Ink, Perforated for 3 Receipts, Total Size 8 1/2" x 11", Each Receipt Size 3 3/5" x 8 1/2"	42	\$36.00	42	\$187.50	42	\$69.00	42	\$80.00	42	NO BID	42	\$50.00	42	NO BID	42	NO BID
TOWNSHIP CLERK			PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD
43	Daily Cat Receipts, Green with Black Ink, 50 Sheets per Pad, 3" x 5"	43	\$0.12	43	\$50.00	43	\$2.49	43	\$6.00	43	NO BID	43	\$0.60	43	\$5.00	43	\$2.39
44	Daily Dog Receipts, Blue with Black Ink, 50 Sheets per Pad, 3" x 5"	44	\$0.12	44	\$50.00	44	\$2.49	44	\$6.00	44	NO BID	44	\$0.60	44	\$5.00	44	\$2.39
TOWNSHIP CLERK			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
45	Beach Vehicle Permit, Green Card Stock, Black Ink, 4" x 2 1/2"	45	\$48.00	45	\$81.25	45	\$28.50	45	\$40.00	45	NO BID	45	\$25.00	45	\$36.00	45	\$28.00
MUNICIPAL COURT			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
46	Victim Involved in Auto Accident, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 3 1/2" x 8 1/2"	46	\$78.00	46	\$156.25	46	\$44.00	46	\$55.00	46	\$93.00	46	\$60.00	46	\$46.00	46	\$43.90
47	Subpoena to Testify, 4-Part NCR, Black Ink, 4" x 8 1/2"	47	\$95.00	47	\$172.23	47	\$54.00	47	\$95.00	47	NO BID	47	\$95.00	47	\$59.00	47	\$54.90
48	Case Memo, Ivory Index Card Stock, Black Ink, 4" x 9"	48	\$80.00	48	\$112.50	48	\$31.00	48	\$35.00	48	NO BID	48	\$45.00	48	\$34.00	48	\$32.00
MUNICIPAL COURT			PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET		PRICE PER BOOKLET
49	Cash Bail Receipt Booklet, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, Number in Red, 1 Receipt/Page, 50 Receipts/Booklet, Booklet Bound on Left with Fold Over Flap, Receipt Size 5"x7"	49	\$33.00	49	\$215.72 / 4 bklets.	49	\$22.25	49	\$25.00	49	NO BID	49	\$50.00	49	NO BID	49	NO BID
50	Municipal Court Receipt Booklet, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, Number in Red, 3 Receipts/Page, 99 Receipts/Booklet, Booklet Bound on Left w/ Fold Over Flap, Receipt Size 5"x12"	50	\$25.00	50	\$551.31 / 12 bklets.	50	\$108.00	50	\$115.00	50	NO BID	50	\$15.00	50	NO BID	50	NO BID
ENGINEERING			PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
51	Engineering Approval Sticker, White with Green Ink, 4 1/4" x 2 3/4"	51	\$48.00	51	\$106.25	51	\$74.00	51	\$80.00	51	NO BID	51	\$55.00	51	\$76.00	51	\$73.00
52	Engineering Rejected Sticker, White with Red Ink, 4 1/4" x 2 3/4"	52	\$48.00	52	\$112.50	52	\$74.00	52	\$80.00	52	NO BID	52	\$55.00	52	\$76.00	52	\$73.00
53	Engineering Not Approved Sticker, Fluorescent Red with Black Ink, 4" x 4"	53	\$90.00	53	\$156.25	53	\$78.00	53	\$95.00	53	NO BID	53	\$75.00	53	\$86.00	53	\$69.00
54	Recommendation for Certificate of Occupancy Inspection Checklist, 4-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	54	\$102.00	54	\$234.52	54	\$96.50	54	\$105.00	54	NO BID	54	\$140.00	54	\$99.00	54	\$96.00

PRELIMINARY RESULTS BC #20017 - PRINTING SERVICES OPEN: 5/29/2020 11:00AM		American Envelope 612 East Elizabeth Ave Linden, NJ 07036		Ascot Tag & Label Company 577 North 3rd Street Newark, NJ 07107		TC Squared, LLC dba Centurion Printing 352 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033		Concept Print 40 Lydecker Street Nyack, NY 10960		Courier Printing Corporation 24 Laurel Bank Ave #1 Deposit, NY 13764		Morgan Printing 333 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Premier Printing Solutions 513 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Tpk Ridgewood, NJ 07450	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE
55	Engineering Permit Application, folded in half, 67 lb. Vellum Bristol Blue, Black Ink, Printing on front only , 11" x 17"	55	\$162.00	55	\$300.00	55	\$96.00	55	\$95.00	55	\$189.00	55	\$125.00	55	\$74.00	55	\$63.00
	ZONING		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
56	Zoning Permit Application, folded in half, 67 lb. Vellum Bristol Green, Black Ink, Printing on all four sides , 11" x 17"	56	\$334.00	56	\$368.75	56	\$96.00	56	\$95.00	56	\$289.00	56	\$130.00	56	\$129.00	56	\$67.00
	CODE ENFORCEMENT		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
57	Residential Rental Certificate of Occupancy Inspection Report, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 14"	57	\$168.00	57	\$285.15	57	\$231.00	57	\$240.00	57	\$444.00	57	\$245.00	57	\$238.00	57	\$120.00
	CODE ENFORCEMENT		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100		PRICE PER 100
58	Illegal Auto Sales, Bright Yellow Sticker, 8 1/2" x 11"	58	\$38.00	58	\$100.00	58	\$394.00	58	\$150.00	58	NO BID	58	\$60.00	58	\$48.00	58	\$75.00
	INSPECTIONS		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
59	UCC F-224A Approval for Fire Protection Sticker, White with Warm Red Ink, 4" x 4"	59	\$90.00	59	\$117.18	59	\$52.00	59	\$70.00	59	NO BID	59	\$65.00	59	\$49.00	59	\$47.00
60	UCC F-225 Approval for Elevator Sticker, White with Pantone Green Ink, 4" x 4"	60	\$140.00	60	\$117.18	60	\$52.00	60	\$70.00	60	NO BID	60	\$65.00	60	\$49.00	60	\$47.00
61	UCC F-350B Cut-In-Card, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 5 1/2" x 4"	61	\$57.00	61	\$156.25	61	\$55.00	61	\$75.00	61	NO BID	61	\$85.00	61	\$58.00	61	\$55.00
62	UCC F-320A Elevator Notice, White Card Stock, Black Ink, 5 1/2" x 8 1/2"	62	\$75.00	62	\$109.37	62	\$38.00	62	\$40.00	62	\$130.00	62	\$40.00	62	\$37.00	62	\$37.50
63	Occupancy Notice, White Card Stock, Black Ink, 9" x 6 1/2"	63	\$95.00	63	\$106.25	63	\$38.00	63	\$40.00	63	\$130.00	63	\$65.00	63	\$52.00	63	\$38.00
64	UCC F-255 Stop Construction Notice, Fluorescent Red Placard with Black Ink, 150 lb. or equal for outdoor display, 6" x 8"	64	\$95.00	64	\$100.00	64	\$70.00	64	\$75.00	64	NO BID	64	\$50.00	64	\$79.00	64	NO BID
65	UCC F-245 Order to Vacate Sign, Fluorescent Red Placard with Black Ink, 6" x 8"	65	\$95.00	65	\$100.00	65	\$60.00	65	\$65.00	65	NO BID	65	\$50.00	65	\$79.00	65	NO BID
66	UCC F-150 Elevator Subcode Form, 4-Part NCR, Pantone Green Ink, 11" x 8 1/2"	66	\$112.00	66	\$284.07	66	\$127.00	66	\$175.00	66	NO BID	66	\$110.00	66	\$128.00	66	\$125.00
67	UCC F-310-1 Elevator Inspection Form Page 1, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	67	\$92.00	67	\$213.02	67	\$94.50	67	\$165.00	67	\$210.00	67	\$95.00	67	\$97.00	67	\$91.00
68	UCC F-310-2 Elevator Inspection Form Page 2, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	68	\$92.00	68	\$247.15	68	\$94.50	68	\$165.00	68	\$210.00	68	\$95.00	68	\$97.00	68	\$91.00
	INSPECTIONS		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
69	UCC F-221B Approval for Building, White Sticker with Black Ink, 4" x 4"	69	\$112.00	69	\$184.37	69	\$82.00	69	\$70.00	69	NO BID	69	\$50.00	69	\$65.00	69	\$81.00
70	UCC F-222A Approval for Electrical, White Sticker with Pantone Purple Ink, 4" x 4"	70	\$112.00	70	\$184.37	70	\$63.50	70	\$55.00	70	NO BID	70	\$55.00	70	\$65.00	70	\$63.00
71	UCC F-223A Approval for Plumbing, White Sticker with Reflex Blue Ink, 4" x 4"	71	\$112.00	71	\$184.37	71	\$63.50	71	\$55.00	71	NO BID	71	\$55.00	71	\$89.00	71	\$63.00
72	UCC F-230B Not Approved, Fluorescent Red Sticker with Black Ink, 4" x 4"	72	\$112.00	72	\$256.25	72	\$80.00	72	\$95.00	72	NO BID	72	\$135.00	72	\$84.00	72	\$78.00
73	UCC F-180-2 Construction Permit Notice, Index Card Stock, color TBD, 2-Sided, 150 lb. for outdoor display, 6" x 8"	73	\$87.00	73	\$175.00	73	\$59.00	73	\$60.00	73	NO BID	73	\$125.00	73	\$93.00	73	NO BID
74	Field Correction Notice, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 7"	74	\$87.00	74	\$249.05	74	\$83.00	74	\$95.00	74	NO BID	74	\$130.00	74	\$99.00	74	\$82.00
75	"Sorry We Missed You" Door Hangers, 2-Sided, Hole on Top, Index Card Stock, White with Blue Ink, 4 1/4" x 11"	75	\$192.00	75	\$325.00	75	\$110.00	75	\$95.00	75	NO BID	75	\$225.00	75	\$111.00	75	\$139.00
76	UCC F-100-1 Construction Permit Application Folder, Black Ink, Printing on all four sides, Ivory Index Card Stock, 11" x 17" folded to 8 1/2" x 11"	76	\$340.00	76	\$337.50	76	\$127.00	76	\$150.00	76	NO BID	76	\$145.00	76	\$127.00	76	\$126.00

PRELIMINARY RESULTS BC #20017 - PRINTING SERVICES OPEN: 5/29/2020 11:00AM		American Envelope 612 East Elizabeth Ave Linden, NJ 07036		Ascot Tag & Label Company 577 North 3rd Street Newark, NJ 07107		TC Squared, LLC dba Centurion Printing 352 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033		Concept Print 40 Lydecker Street Nyack, NY 10960		Courier Printing Corporation 24 Laurel Bank Ave #1 Deposit, NY 13764		Morgan Printing 333 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Premier Printing Solutions 513 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Tpk Ridgewood, NJ 07450	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE		
77	UCC F-110 Building Subcode Form, 4-Part NCR, Black Ink, 11" x 8 1/2"	77	\$165.00	77	\$275.70	77	\$191.00	77	\$175.00	77	NO BID	77	\$155.00	77	\$195.00	77	\$164.00
78	UCC F-120 Electrical Subcode Form, 4-Part NCR, Purple Ink, 11" x 8 1/2"	78	\$165.00	78	\$264.78	78	\$191.00	78	\$175.00	78	NO BID	78	\$160.00	78	\$195.00	78	\$164.00
79	UCC F-130 Plumbing Subcode Form, 4-Part NCR, Blue Ink, 11" x 8 1/2"	79	\$165.00	79	\$264.78	79	\$191.00	79	\$175.00	79	NO BID	79	\$160.00	79	\$195.00	79	\$164.00
80	UCC F-140 Fire Protection Subcode Form, 4-Part NCR, Red Ink, 11" x 8 1/2"	80	\$165.00	80	\$264.78	80	\$191.00	80	\$175.00	80	NO BID	80	\$160.00	80	\$195.00	80	\$217.00
81	UCC F-145 Mechanical Subcode Form, 4-Part NCR, Black Ink, 11" x 8 1/2"	81	\$165.00	81	\$264.78	81	\$191.00	81	\$175.00	81	NO BID	81	\$155.00	81	\$195.00	81	\$164.00
	EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
82	Emergency Medical Services Flyer, Tri-folded, 2-Sided, Semi-Glossy Paper, See Attached for Ink Colors, 8 1/2" x 11"	82	\$156.00	82	NO BID	82	\$423.00	82	\$125.00	82	\$489.00	82	\$295.00	82	\$169.00	82	\$144.00
83	EMS Flyer Car Seat Safety, Tri-folded, 2-Sided, Semi-Glossy Paper, See Attached for Ink Colors, 8 1/2" x 11"	83	\$156.00	83	\$337.50	83	\$423.00	83	\$125.00	83	\$489.00	83	\$295.00	83	\$169.00	83	\$144.00
	EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD		PRICE PER PAD
84	EMS Patient Pad, Black Ink, 2-Sided, 50 Sheets/Pad, Bound on Top, 3 3/4" x 5"	84	\$8.90	84	\$81.25	84	\$2.49	84	\$10.00	84	NO BID	84	\$2.50	84	\$3.49	84	\$3.00
	EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
85	EMS Department Equipment, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	85	\$92.00	85	\$213.02	85	\$168.00	85	\$95.00	85	\$210.00	85	\$95.00	85	\$84.00	85	\$91.00
86	EMS Communication Equipment, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	86	\$92.00	86	\$213.02	86	\$168.00	86	\$95.00	86	\$210.00	86	\$95.00	86	\$84.00	86	\$91.00
87	EMS Uniform Order Form, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	87	\$92.00	87	\$213.02	87	\$168.00	87	\$95.00	87	\$210.00	87	\$95.00	87	\$84.00	87	\$91.00
88	EMS Uniform Receipt Form, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	88	\$92.00	88	\$213.02	88	\$168.00	88	\$95.00	88	\$210.00	88	\$95.00	88	\$84.00	88	\$91.00
	PUBLIC SAFETY		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500		PRICE PER 500
89	Vehicle Release, White Index Card Stock, Black Ink, 6" x 4"	89	\$46.00	89	\$93.75	89	\$30.00	89	\$40.00	89	\$245.00	89	\$35.00	89	\$41.00	89	\$29.00
90	BT-109A Death Leave Request, 3-Part NCR (Green, Yellow, Pink), Black Ink, 7" x 8 1/2"	90	\$64.00	90	\$230.26	90	\$119.00	90	\$145.00	90	NO BID	90	\$130.00	90	\$125.00	90	\$118.00
91	BTPD Boating Accident Report, 3-Page Report, Each Page 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	91	\$92.00	91	\$468.75	91	\$230.00	91	\$250.00	91	NO BID	91	\$120.00	91	\$235.00	91	\$76.00
92	Potential Liability Form (English), 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, Shaded Area, 8 1/2" x 11"	92	\$73.00	92	\$179.22	92	\$52.00	92	\$85.00	92	\$143.00	92	\$95.00	92	\$57.00	92	\$53.00
93	Potential Liability Form (Spanish), 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, Shaded Area, 8 1/2" x 11"	93	\$73.00	93	\$208.76	93	\$52.00	93	\$85.00	93	\$143.00	93	\$95.00	93	\$57.00	93	\$53.00
94	BT-104 Voluntary Statement Form, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	94	\$92.00	94	\$213.02	94	\$61.00	94	\$95.00	94	\$210.00	94	\$120.00	94	\$76.00	94	\$61.00
95	Return & Supplemental Search Warrant Inventory Return, 2-Page Report, Each Page 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	95	\$174.00	95	\$314.75	95	\$141.00	95	\$245.00	95	NO BID	95	\$195.00	95	\$218.00	95	\$139.00
96	Missing Person Report, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	96	\$92.00	96	\$247.15	96	\$211.00	96	\$95.00	96	\$210.00	96	\$120.00	96	\$92.00	96	\$61.00
97	Discovery Packet Checklist, 3-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	97	\$79.00	97	\$247.15	97	\$346.00	97	\$95.00	97	\$340.00	97	\$120.00	97	\$92.00	97	\$61.00
98	Confidential Information Form, 3-Part NCR, 3rd Page is 2-Sided, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	98	\$89.00	98	\$245.83	98	\$159.00	98	\$105.00	98	NO BID	98	\$145.00	98	\$109.00	98	\$109.00
99	Victim Property Loss Report, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	99	\$73.00	99	\$179.22	99	\$53.00	99	\$85.00	99	\$143.00	99	\$95.00	99	\$62.00	99	\$52.00

PRELIMINARY RESULTS BC #20017 - PRINTING SERVICES OPEN: 5/29/2020 11:00AM		American Envelope 612 East Elizabeth Ave Linden, NJ 07036		Ascot Tag & Label Company 577 North 3rd Street Newark, NJ 07107		TC Squared, LLC dba Centurion Printing 352 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033		Concept Print 40 Lydecker Street Nyack, NY 10960		Courier Printing Corporation 24 Laurel Bank Ave #1 Deposit, NY 13764		Morgan Printing 333 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Premier Printing Solutions 513 South Pine Ave South Amboy, NJ 08879		Ridgewood Press 609 Franklin Tpk Ridgewood, NJ 07450	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE	#	PRICE
100	BTPD-311 Vessel Data, 2-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 5 1/2"	100	\$60.00	100	\$156.25	100	\$105.00	100	\$80.00	100	NO BID	100	\$50.00	100	\$58.00	100	\$59.00
101	BTPD-325 Walk-in Incident Report, 4-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	101	\$112.00	101	\$234.52	101	\$151.00	101	\$150.00	101	NO BID	101	\$125.00	101	\$114.00	101	\$138.00
102	K-9 Investigation Report, 2-Page Report, Each Page 4-Part NCR, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	102	\$112.00	102	\$396.60	102	\$305.00	102	\$285.00	102	NO BID	102	\$250.00	102	\$236.00	102	\$259.00
PUBLIC SAFETY			PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000		PRICE PER 1,000
103	BT-115 Radio Message, Green Card Stock, Hole on Top Center, Black Ink, 6" x 4"	103	\$56.00	103	\$187.50	103	\$90.00	103	\$95.00	103	\$242.00	103	\$80.00	103	\$92.00	103	\$89.00
104	BT-118 Sick/Injured Card, Blue Card Stock, Black Ink, 6" x 4"	104	\$58.00	104	\$112.50	104	\$49.00	104	\$75.00	104	\$311.00	104	\$78.00	104	\$43.00	104	\$40.00
105	BT-208A Incident/Case Number Card, Green Card Stock, Black Ink, 7 1/2" x 3 1/4"	105	\$48.00	105	\$131.25	105	\$49.00	105	\$75.00	105	\$478.00	105	\$65.00	105	\$44.00	105	\$37.00
106	BT-251 - Push/Lockout Card, White Card, Black Ink, 7 1/2" x 3 1/2"	106	\$56.00	106	\$131.25	106	\$43.00	106	\$60.00	106	\$273.00	106	\$55.00	106	\$44.00	106	\$49.00
107	BTPD Traffic Warning, 2-Part NCR, Page 1 is Paper, Black and Red Color Ink, Page 2 is Manila Card Stock, Black Ink, 4" x 9"	107	\$153.00	107	\$227.23	107	\$180.00	107	\$110.00	107	NO BID	107	\$145.00	107	\$109.00	107	\$118.00
108	Identity Theft Flyer, Tri-folded, Semi-Glossy Paper, See Attached for Ink Colors, 8 1/2" x 11"	108	\$146.00	108	\$337.50	108	\$180.00	108	\$150.00	108	\$489.00	108	\$295.00	108	\$165.00	108	\$144.00
109	Employment Opportunities Flyer, Tri-folded, Semi-Glossy Paper, See Attached for Ink Colors, 8 1/2" x 11"	109	\$146.00	109	\$337.50	109	\$180.00	109	\$150.00	109	\$489.00	109	\$295.00	109	\$165.00	109	\$144.00
110	Drug Enforcement Unit Field Information Card, White Index Card Stock, Black Ink, 8" x 5"	110	\$45.00	110	\$156.25	110	\$47.00	110	\$75.00	110	\$273.00	110	\$65.00	110	\$51.00	110	\$45.00
111	NJ Domestic Violence Civil Complaint, 5-Page Report, Pages 1-4 of the Report are 5-Part NCR, Page 5 is Single Page, Black Ink, 8 1/2" x 11"	111	\$778.00	111	\$1,170.50	111	\$1,986.00	111	\$1,250.00	111	NO BID	111	\$2,880.00	111	\$1,192.00	111	\$1,070.00