

<b>PRELIMINARY RESULTS</b> <b>BC #20021 - AUTO. PARTS, SUPPLIES AND</b> <b>REPAIRS FOR VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GWV</b> <b>OPEN: 8/25/2020 11:00 AM</b>		Larson Ford, Inc. 1150 Ocean Avenue Lakewood, NJ 08701				SeaBreeze Ford, Inc. 1701 Route 35 Wall, NJ 07719			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	LABOR RATE	DISCOUNT	LABOR RATE	DISCOUNT	LABOR RATE	DISCOUNT	LABOR RATE	DISCOUNT
MANUFACTURER		FORD		GM		CHRYSLER		FORD	
1	Engine Diagnostics and Repairs	\$117.77	35%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
2	Transmission Repairs	\$117.77	35%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
3	Exhaust Systems, Repair and/or Replacement	\$87.77	36%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
4	Steering and Suspension Repair and/or Replacement	\$97.77	35%	\$97.77	22%	NO BID		\$109.00	35%
4a	Front End Alignment	\$89.00	FLAT RATE	\$89.00	FLAT RATE	\$89.00	FLAT RATE	\$80.00	FLAT RATE
5	Heating, Cooling & Air Conditioning Repairs	\$117.77	36%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
5	A/C Charge	\$99.77	FLAT RATE	NO BID		NO BID		\$140.00	FLAT RATE
6	Electrical Repairs	\$117.77	35%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
7	Brake System Repairs	\$87.77	35%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
8	Drive Components Repairs	\$97.77	35%	NO BID		NO BID		\$109.00	35%
YEARS IN BUSINESS		64						41	