

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, sealed bids were received by the Division of Purchasing and Contracting of the Township of Brick for Purchase and Delivery of Sign Materials on Wednesday, January 26, 2022; and

WHEREAS, the bids have been reviewed by the Superintendent of Public Works; and

WHEREAS, the Superintendent of Public Works has recommended the award of said bid to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder on per item basis being in full compliance with the bid specification; and

WHEREAS, the Superintendent of Public Works desires to solicit new bids for the Purchase and Delivery of Sign Materials for the items not awarded.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THE TOWNSHIP COUNCIL OF THE TOWNSHIP OF BRICK, COUNTY OF OCEAN AND STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. That the contract for Purchase and Delivery of Sign Materials is hereby awarded on per item basis as per the attached schedule of prices to the following vendors:
 - Garden State Highway Products, Inc., 301 Riverside Drive, Millville, NJ 08332
 - Signarama Freehold, 23 South Street, Freehold, NJ 07728
2. That this is an open-ended contract not to exceed \$70,000.00 per year with funds to be certified prior to each order. Sufficient funds are available pending adoption of the 2022 and future budgets under an appropriation entitled Roads – Traffic Sign Parts & Materials, account 2-01-26-290-258.
3. That this will be a two (2) year contract commencing on February 12, 2022 and ending on February 11, 2024.
4. That the Mayor is hereby authorized to execute and the Clerk to attest to the proposed form of agreement aforesaid, which such agreement shall be available for public examination in the office of the Township Clerk during normal business hours.
5. That the Township Council authorizes and directs the Purchasing Agent to advertise and solicit new bids for the remaining items.
6. That a copy of this resolution shall be forwarded to the vendors, Business Administrator, Chief Financial Officer, Superintendent of Public Works and Purchasing Agent.

cc: 2/8/22

CERTIFICATION

I, Lynnette A. Iannarone, Clerk of the Township of Brick in the County of Ocean and State of New Jersey, do certify that the foregoing resolution was duly passed by the Township Council of the Township of Brick at a regular meeting of said Council on the 8th day of February, 2022.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and seal of this Township this 8th day of February, 2022.

Lynnette A. Iannarone
LYNNETTE A. IANNARONE
TOWNSHIP CLERK

Agenda #	2/8/22
4-7	
Agenda #	Date
Agenda #	Date
Agenda #	Date

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
CATEGORY 1 - ALUMINUM TRAFFIC SIGN BLANKS ALCOA 5052-H38, OR EQUAL (ANODIZED)					
1	9" x 12"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$4.95	Garden State Highway Products
2	10" x 12"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$5.93	Garden State Highway Products
3	12" x 18"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$8.76	Garden State Highway Products
4	12" x 24"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$12.05	Garden State Highway Products
5	12" x 36"	-	-	\$17.99	Signarama Freehold
6	18" x 18"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$13.56	Garden State Highway Products
7	18" x 24"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$18.07	Garden State Highway Products
8	24" x 24"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$24.11	Garden State Highway Products
9	6" x 30"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$7.89	Garden State Highway Products
10	24" x 30"	ALCOA / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$30.13	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 2 - PRE-MADE SIGNS REFLECTIVE, ENGINEER GRADE, ALUMINUM TRAFFIC SIGNS, ALCOA 5052-H38, OR EQUAL (ANODIZED)					
11	Chevron (OM-1L), 8" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$14.78	Garden State Highway Products
12	Chevron (OM-1R), 8" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$14.78	Garden State Highway Products
13	Crime Watch, 18" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$24.72	Garden State Highway Products
14	Crime Watch, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
15	Do Not Enter, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$48.77	Garden State Highway Products

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
16	Dog Waste, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
17	Keep Right, 24" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$39.02	Garden State Highway Products
18	No Parking Fire Lane, R7-22 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
19	One Way Arrow (R6-1L), 12" x 36"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
20	One Way Arrow (R6-1R), 12" x 36"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
21	School Crossing (S1-1), 36" x 36"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$70.23	Garden State Highway Products
22	Stop, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$48.77	Garden State Highway Products
23	No Outlet (W14-2), 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$48.77	Garden State Highway Products
24	No Right Turn (symbol), 24" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$32.14	Garden State Highway Products
25	No Right Turn (words), 24" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
26	No Left Turn (symbol), 24" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$32.14	Garden State Highway Products
27	No Left Turn (words), 24" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
28	No Parking Fire Zone (white w/ red border & letters), 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
29	Wrong Way, 36" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$46.81	Garden State Highway Products
30	Reserved Parking (handicap) (R7-8), 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
31	Penalty (handicap) (R7-8P), 10" x 12"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$9.44	Garden State Highway Products
32	Van Accessible (R7-8VA), 12" x 6"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$5.80	Garden State Highway Products

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
33	Caution Children At Play, 18" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
34	No Parking Any Time, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
35	No Parking, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
36	No Stopping and Standing, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
37	25 MPH Speed Limit, 24" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$39.02	Garden State Highway Products
38	35 MPH Speed Limit, 24" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$39.02	Garden State Highway Products
39	No U Turn (symbol), 24" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$32.14	Garden State Highway Products
40	No U Turn (words), 24" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 3 - PRE-MADE SIGNS (BLANK) REFLECTIVE, ENGINEER GRADE, ALUMINUM TRAFFIC SIGNS, ALCOA 5052-H38, OR EQUAL (ANODIZED)					
41	White, Black Border, Reflective, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
42	White, Green Border, Reflective, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
43	White, Red Border, Reflective, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
44	White, Black Border, Reflective, 18" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
45	White, Red Border, Reflective, 18" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$17.56	Garden State Highway Products
46	White, Red Border, Reflective, 18" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
47	Yellow, Black Border, Reflective, 18" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
48	Yellow, Black Border, Reflective, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$48.77	Garden State Highway Products

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
49	White, Blue Border, Reflective, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
50	White, Orange Border, Reflective, 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
51	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl 12" x 18"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$16.17	Garden State Highway Products
52	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 12" x 12"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$9.50	Garden State Highway Products
53	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 6" x 12"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$5.80	Garden State Highway Products
54	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 12" x 36"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
55	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 18" x 24"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$23.41	Garden State Highway Products
56	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 24" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$39.02	Garden State Highway Products
57	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 24" x 36"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$46.81	Garden State Highway Products
58	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$48.77	Garden State Highway Products
59	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 30" x 48"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$78.03	Garden State Highway Products
60	White, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 48" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$78.03	Garden State Highway Products
61	Blue, No Border, Reflective Vinyl, 6" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$14.84	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 4 - PRE-MADE SIGNS (DECAL)					
62	25 MPH, Reflective Decal, 24" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	25 per box	\$10.26	Garden State Highway Products
63	35 MPH, Reflective Decal, 24" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	25 per box	\$10.26	Garden State Highway Products
64	Do Not Enter, Reflective Decal, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	25 per box	\$18.32	Garden State Highway Products

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
65	No Outlet, Reflective Decal, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	25 per box	\$18.32	Garden State Highway Products
66	Stop, Reflective Decal, 30" x 30"	3M 7310 / GSHP	25 per box	\$18.32	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 5 - STREET SIGNS					
GREEN, HI-INTENSITY PRISMATIC REFLECTIVE, INSTALLED ON BOTH SIDES OF BLANK, DOUBLE SIDED, EXTRUDED (SHAPED) BLADES, BLADES HAVE A THICKNESS OF .080" (CENTER) WITH EXTRUDED TOP AND BOTTOM EDGES AT .230" THICK					
67	Street Sign, 6" x 18"	3M 3937 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$13.31	Garden State Highway Products
68	Street Sign, 6" x 24"	3M 3937 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$17.74	Garden State Highway Products
69	Street Sign, 6" x 30"	3M 3937 / GSHP	10 per bundle	\$22.18	Garden State Highway Products
70	90 Degree, Cross Separator for 2nd Street	MDS / GSHP	50 per box	\$12.20	Garden State Highway Products
71	Round Cap Holder, 2-3/8" dia.	MDS / GSHP	50 per box	\$12.20	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 6 - SIGN POSTS					
PARKING OR TRAFFIC SIGN MOUNTING POST, 2-3/8" DIAMETER, ROUND, U CHANNEL WITH A STANDARD HOLD DIAMETER OF 3/8", SPACED OUT 1"					
72	Galvanized Round Post, 12'	-	-	\$49.99	Signarama Freehold
73	Green U-Channel Post, 12'	Nucor Steel	50 per bundle	\$30.64	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 7 - GERBER 280 SERIES VINYL					
7.5 MIL REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 7-YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE ON ALL COLORS, 5-YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE ON BLACK, 15" PUNCHED EDGE READY, 50					
74	Black (280-85)	-	-	\$949.99	Signarama Freehold
75	Blue (280-75)	-	-	\$949.99	Signarama Freehold
76	Gold (280-64)	-	-	\$949.99	Signarama Freehold
77	Green (280-77)	-	-	\$1,029.99	Signarama Freehold
78	Lemon Yellow (280-81)	-	-	\$1,029.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
79	Light Blue (280-76)	-	-	\$1,039.99	Signarama Freehold
80	Orange (280-14)	-	-	\$949.99	Signarama Freehold
81	Red (280-72)	-	-	\$1,029.99	Signarama Freehold
82	Ruby Red (280-82)	-	-	\$929.99	Signarama Freehold
83	White 280i (280-10)	-	-	\$989.99	Signarama Freehold
84	Yellow (280-71)	-	-	\$949.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 8 - GERBER 210 FLORESCENT FILM					
5 MIL FLORESCENT SHEETING, 1-YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE, 15" PUNCHED EDGE READY, 10 YARD ROLL					
85	Lemon-Yellow (210-405)	-	-	\$159.99	Signarama Freehold
86	Lime Green (210-406)	-	-	\$159.99	Signarama Freehold
87	Pink (210-413)	-	-	\$159.99	Signarama Freehold
88	Red-Orange (210-414)	-	-	\$159.99	Signarama Freehold
89	Yellow Orange (201-404)	-	-	\$159.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 9 - GERBER COLOR PROCESS PRO CMYK FOILS EDGE FX					
TO PRODUCE PHOTOGRAPHIC BITMAP REPRODUCTION, 3-YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE, FOR USE ON EDGE READY MATERIAL, 45 METER FOILS					
90	Process Black (GPC-817)	-	-	NO BID	-
91	Process Cyan (GPC-807)	-	-	NO BID	-
92	Process Magenta (GPC-873)	-	-	NO BID	-
93	Process Yellow (GPC-805)	-	-	NO BID	-

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS

CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
CATEGORY 10 - GERBER COLOR TRANSPARENT FOILS EDGE FX, 45 METER FOILS					
94	Blue	-	-	\$139.99	Signarama Freehold
95	Brown	-	-	\$139.99	Signarama Freehold
96	Burgundy	-	-	NO BID	-
97	Gold	-	-	\$249.99	Signarama Freehold
98	Gray	-	-	\$119.99	Signarama Freehold
99	Orange	-	-	\$139.99	Signarama Freehold
100	Plum Purple	-	-	\$139.99	Signarama Freehold
101	Red	-	-	\$139.88	Signarama Freehold
102	Sapphire Blue	-	-	\$139.99	Signarama Freehold
103	White	-	-	\$139.99	Signarama Freehold
104	GSP Edge FX Aprsn Grd SPF 91M	-	-	NO BID	-
105	Edge FX Gold Medal 15m film - P77701A	-	-	NO BID	-
CATEGORY 11 - EDGE FX CADDIES					
106	Single EDGE FX Caddy	-	-	\$32.99	Signarama Freehold
107	Single EDGE FX Caddy 18 Pack	-	-	\$489.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
CATEGORY 12 - GERBER COLOR SPOT COLOR FOILS EDGE FX					
SEMI-GLOSS SPOT COLOR FOIL WITH 3-5 YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE, FOR USE ON EDGE READY MATERIAL, 45 METER FOILS					
108	Apple Green	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
109	Artic White	-	-	\$119.99	Signarama Freehold
110	Atomic Red	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
111	Bark Gray	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
112	Beige	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
113	Burgundy	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
114	Black	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
115	Brown	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
116	Cobalt Blue	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
117	Dark Green	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
118	Electric Green	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
119	Fire Ball Red	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
120	Forest Green	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
121	Gray	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
122	Intense Red	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
123	Intense Blue	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
124	Kelly Green	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
125	Kumquat	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
126	Lemon Yellow	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
127	Light Purple	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
128	Light Gray	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
129	Lime Green	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
130	Light Navy	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
131	Navy	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
132	Olympic Blue	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
133	Orange	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
134	Peacock Blue	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
135	Purple	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
136	Royal Reflex	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
137	Ruby Red	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
138	Silver	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
139	Sunflower Yellow	-	-	NO BID	-
140	Tan *15m	-	-	NO BID	-

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS

CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
141	Teal	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
142	Tomato Red	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
143	White	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
144	Yellow	-	-	\$149.99	Signarama Freehold
145	Gold (Metallic)	-	-	\$149.99	Signarama Freehold
146	Imitation Gold (Metallic)	-	-	\$149.99	Signarama Freehold
147	Silver (Metallic)	-	-	\$149.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 13 - VECTOR PRO V-5 SERIES HIGH GLOSS VINYL					
2.8 MIL, 4-6 YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE, 50 YARDS, PV50XX1550, 15" PUNCHED EDGE READY					
148	Clear	-	-	NO BID	-
149	Black	-	-	NO BID	-
150	White	-	-	NO BID	-
151	Standard Colors	-	-	NO BID	-
CATEGORY 14 - VECTOR PRO V-7 ENGINEERING GRADE REFLECTIVE VINYL					
7 MIL, 7-YEAR EXTERIOR LIFE, PERMANENT SOLVENT ADHESIVE, 50 YARDS, V900XX1550, 15" PUNCHED EDGE READY					
152	Black	-	-	NO BID	-
153	Blue	-	-	NO BID	-
154	Dark Red	-	-	NO BID	-
155	Gold	-	-	NO BID	-

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
156	Green	-	-	NO BID	-
157	Light Blue	-	-	NO BID	-
158	Orange	-	-	NO BID	-
159	Red	-	-	NO BID	-
160	Yellow	-	-	NO BID	-
161	White	-	-	NO BID	-
CATEGORY 15- VECTOR PRO V200 CAST ULTRA METALLIC FLEXIBLE, OPAQUE SOLID COLOR, HIGH GLOSS, METALLIC VINYL FILM. V200XX1550, 50 YARDS, 15" PUNCHED EDGE READY					
162	Black	-	-	NO BID	-
163	Blue	-	-	NO BID	-
164	Cobalt	-	-	NO BID	-
165	Emerald	-	-	NO BID	-
166	Fire Opal	-	-	NO BID	-
167	Gold	-	-	NO BID	-
168	Red	-	-	NO BID	-
169	Rose	-	-	NO BID	-
CATEGORY 16 - FDC SERIES 3501-1550-XXX, PROMOTIONAL GRADE CAST FLOURESCENT VINYL FILM DESIGNED FOR GRAPHIC AND SIGNAGE REQUIRING SHORT TERM DURABILITY, 2 MIL, 50 YARDS, 15" PUNCHED EDGE READY					
170	Blue	-	-	NO BID	-

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
171	Green	-	-	NO BID	-
172	Magenta	-	-	NO BID	-
173	Orange	-	-	NO BID	-
174	Red	-	-	NO BID	-
175	Yellow	-	-	NO BID	-
176	FDC 3M RELF Blue 15" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
CATEGORY 17 - BANNER BLANKS					
GLOSS WHITE, SEWN ON ALL FOUR SIDES WITH NICKEL GROMMET 2-3 FOOT INTERVALS, 13 OZ					
177	21" x 4'	-	-	\$19.99	Signarama Freehold
178	21" x 6'	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
179	21" x 8'	-	-	\$24.99	Signarama Freehold
180	21" x 10'	-	-	\$29.99	Signarama Freehold
181	21" x 12'	-	-	\$34.99	Signarama Freehold
182	21" x 15'	-	-	\$45.99	Signarama Freehold
183	21" x 20'	-	-	\$49.99	Signarama Freehold
184	33" x 6'	-	-	\$36.99	Signarama Freehold
185	33" x 8'	-	-	\$40.99	Signarama Freehold
186	33" x 10'	-	-	\$46.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS

CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
187	33" x 12'	-	-	\$52.99	Signarama Freehold
188	33" x 15'	-	-	\$59.99	Signarama Freehold
189	33" x 20'	-	-	\$100.99	Signarama Freehold
190	45" x 6'	-	-	\$29.99	Signarama Freehold
191	45" x 8'	-	-	\$34.99	Signarama Freehold
192	45" x 10'	-	-	\$38.99	Signarama Freehold
193	45" x 12'	-	-	\$46.99	Signarama Freehold
194	45" x 15'	-	-	\$64.99	Signarama Freehold
195	45" x 20'	-	-	\$102.99	Signarama Freehold
196	FDC 80 oz. Banner Mesh WH 54" x 40 yards	-	-	\$249.99	Signarama Freehold
197	FDC 8 oz. Banner Mesh WH 54' x 50 yards	-	-	\$929.00	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 18 - BANNER BLANKS					
GLOSS COLOR (BLACK, RED, BLUE, GREEN, OR YELLOW)					
198	21" x 4'	-	-	NO BID	-
199	21" x 6'	-	-	NO BID	-
200	21" x 8'	23" x 8'	-	\$32.99	Signarama Freehold
201	21" x 10'	23" x 10'	-	\$39.99	Signarama Freehold
202	21" x 12'	23" x 12'	-	\$49.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
203	21" x 15'	23" x 15'	-	\$89.99	Signarama Freehold
204	21" x 20'	23" x 20'	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
205	33" x 6'	34" x 6'	-	\$39.99	Signarama Freehold
206	33" x 8'	34" x 8'	-	\$59.99	Signarama Freehold
207	33" x 10'	34" x 10'	-	\$89.99	Signarama Freehold
208	33" x 12'	34" x 12'	-	\$109.99	Signarama Freehold
209	33" x 15'	34" x 15'	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
210	33" x 20'	34" x 20'	-	\$189.99	Signarama Freehold
211	45" x 6'	48" x 6'	-	\$59.99	Signarama Freehold
212	45" x 8'	48" x 8'	-	\$79.99	Signarama Freehold
213	45" x 10'	48" x 10'	-	\$99.99	Signarama Freehold
214	45" x 12'	48" x 12'	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
215	45" x 15'	48" x 15'	-	\$149.99	Signarama Freehold
216	45" x 20'	48" x 20'	-	\$199.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 19 - RAPID REMOVER, NON-TOXIC, WATER-SOLUBLE, ADHESIVE REMOVER SPRAY ON AND WIPE AWAY RESIDUE ADHESIVE WITHOUT CAUSING DAMAGE TO MOST PAINTED OR BARE METAL SURFACES					
217	Rapid-Rem-Jug, Adhesive Remover, 128 oz Jug	GALLON RAPID REMOVER	-	\$99.99	Signarama Freehold
218	Rapid-Tac-Application Fluid, 128 oz Jug	GALLON RAPID TAC	-	\$68.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
CATEGORY 20 - R-TAPE STANDARD PAPER APPLICATION TAPE					
219	4075C-1, 1" x 100 yards	R-TAPE	1 roll per carton	\$5.12	Garden State Highway Products
220	4075C-2, 2" x 100 yards	2.25" 4075 APLITAPE	-	\$9.99	Signarama Freehold
221	4075C-3, 3" x 100 yards	3.25" 4075 APLITAPE	-	\$11.99	Signarama Freehold
222	4075C-4, 4" x 100 yards	4.25" 4075 APLITAPE	-	\$19.99	Signarama Freehold
223	4075C-6, 6" x 100 yards	6.5" 4075 APLITAPE	-	\$29.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 21 - COROPLAST, FLUTED POLYPROPYLENE					
224	Black, 4' x 8' sheet	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
225	Light Blue, 4' x 8' sheet	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
226	Orange, 4' x 8' sheet	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
227	Red, 4' x 8' sheet	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
228	White, 4' x 8' sheet	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
229	Yellow, 4' x 8' sheet	-	-	\$22.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 22 - SPECIAL VINYL					
230	3M (3937) Green, High Intensity Prismatic Reflective Sheeting, 6" x 50 yard roll	3M	1 roll per carton	\$126.64	Garden State Highway Products
231	Gerber 220-114 Clear Enamel Receptive, 15" Punched Edge Ready, 50 yard roll	-	-	\$269.99	Signarama Freehold
232	Gerber Static Cling, Clear, 15" Punched Edge Ready, 50 yard roll	-	-	\$149.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
233	Gerber PVC-10, White, 15" Punched Edge Ready, 50 yard roll	-	-	\$329.99	Signarama Freehold
234	Orajet 3620E-000 Digital Printing Media, 50"	-	-	\$159.99	Signarama Freehold
235	Gerber 210-314 Dusted Crystal, 15" x 50 yards	15" x 10 YARDS	-	\$199.99	Signarama Freehold
236	Gerber 220 3M 7125 69 Duranodic, 48" x 10 yards	GERBER P83671A	-	\$199.99	Signarama Freehold
237	GF Matte Whi Carper 3.4 CL HT RA, 54" x 150'	209-54 GF209 METROMARK35	-	\$299.99	Signarama Freehold
238	Gloss White, 48" x 25 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
239	Sat Roar Thunde, 48" x 25 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
240	3M (3630) Sultan Blue, 48" x 10 yards	3630-157-4810	48" x 10 yards	\$269.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 23 - ARLON LAYER VINYL (MUTOH VALVE JET PRINTER)					
241	DPF 4500LX, White, Vinyl, 54" x 50 yards	-	-	\$283.99	Signarama Freehold
242	FDC Premium Cast Vinyl, Gloss White, 54" x 25 yards	DPF 6000RP	-	\$698.99	Signarama Freehold
243	FDC Reflective Digital Eng., White, Vinyl, 48" x 25 yards	ILLUMINITE 48" x 25 yards	-	\$1,099.99	Signarama Freehold
244	FDC 13oz. Banner, Gloss White, Vinyl, 54" x 40 yards	54" x 115' 1000D	-	\$130.99	Signarama Freehold
245	Oracle Vinyl Clear/Arlon 6000, Series 3620, 54" wide	6000RP GLOSS	-	\$699.99	Signarama Freehold
246	FDC Banner Mesh, 8oz, White, 54" x 40 yards	54" x 164' STRIP MESH ULTRAFLEX	SMP137050	\$329.99	Signarama Freehold
247	Concept 212 3.4M Mat Whi Carp HT RA, 54" x 150'	212-54	-	\$299.99	Signarama Freehold
248	Concept 109 Scr Res Clear 5.0 PA LAM, 54" x 150'	OVERLAM 109-54	-	\$429.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
CATEGORY 24 - INK CARTRIDGE (MUTOH V3-1324 VALVE JET PRINTER)					
249	Eco Solvent Cartidge, 11476-001	-	-	NO BID	-
250	Black, 220ml, VJ-MSINK3A-BK220, Eco Solvent Ultra	-	-	NO BID	-
251	Cyan, 220ml, VJ-MSINK3A-CY220, Eco Solvent Ultra	-	-	NO BID	-
252	Yellow, 220ml, VJ-MSINK3A-YE220, Eco Solvent Ultra	-	-	NO BID	-
253	Magenta, 220ml, VJ-MSINK3A-MA220, Eco Solvent Ultra	-	-	NO BID	-
CATEGORY 25 - STENCILS					
254	NO, 18" Letters, Heavyweight, 1/8" Thick Poly-Vinyl	POLY STENCIL	1 per pack	\$36.21	Garden State Highway Products
255	PARKING, 18" Letters, Heavyweight, 1/8" Thick Poly-Vinyl	POLY STENCIL	1 per pack	\$126.72	Garden State Highway Products
256	FIRE, 18" Letters, Heavyweight, 1/8" Thick Poly-Vinyl	POLY STENCIL	1 per pack	\$72.41	Garden State Highway Products
257	ZONE, 18" Letters, Heavyweight, 1/8" Thick Poly-Vinyl	POLY STENCIL	1 per pack	\$72.41	Garden State Highway Products
258	LANE, 18" Letters, Heavyweight, 1/8" Thick Poly-Vinyl	POLY STENCIL	1 per pack	\$72.41	Garden State Highway Products
259	HANDICAPPED, 18" Letters, Heavyweight, 1/8" Thick Poly-Vinyl	POLY STENCIL	1 per pack	\$209.00	Garden State Highway Products
CATEGORY 26 - SPECIALTY ITEMS					
260	3M Plastic Blue Applicators (box of 25) 75-3454-4264-6	-	-	\$30.99	Signarama Freehold
261	Double Sided Banner Tape,1" x 36'	X-TREME BANTAPE	1" x 36 yards	\$29.99	Signarama Freehold
262	#2 Brass Self Piercing Grommet w/flat Washer (box of 500)	-	-	\$62.99	Signarama Freehold
263	Superfrog, Frog Juice, Sunscreen Clear 7000, (quart)	-	-	\$39.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
264	Mega Banner Tape, 1.5" x 30 yards	MEGATAPE CL	1.5" x 30 yards	\$39.99	Signarama Freehold
265	U-Top Galvanized Corostake with 5.5" Base, 10" x 30"	HEAVY DUTY	-	\$5.99	Signarama Freehold
266	Hex Cap Screw Grade 5 Zinc, 5/16-18 x 2-1/2	-	-	\$0.32	Garden State Highway Products
267	Steel Flat Washer USS, 5/16	-	-	\$0.18	Garden State Highway Products
268	Hex Nut Grade 5 Zinc, 5/16-18	-	-	\$0.25	Garden State Highway Products
269	Steel Split Lock Washer Zinc, 5/16	-	-	\$0.19	Garden State Highway Products
270	Swanson 36" Aluminum Ruler	YELLOW	-	\$6.99	Signarama Freehold
271	Bombsight, Packaged	-	-	\$99.99	Signarama Freehold
272	White Vinyl Post and Rail Kit, 48" x 96"	-	-	\$399.99	Signarama Freehold
273	GF 212 Matte White Carpet 3.4 CT HT RA, 54" x 150'	-	-	\$319.99	Signarama Freehold
CATEGORY 27- MISCELLANEOUS					
274	Gerber Luminous Film, Light Yellow-Green, Matte, 13 mil Glow-in-the-Dark Sheeting, 1-year exterior life, 15" Punched Edge Ready, 10 yard roll	P68496A	15" x 25 yards	\$1,499.99	Signarama Freehold
275	Gerber Auto Mag II, White, Vehicle Strength, 24 mil magnetic material used to make removable vehicle graphics, flexible smooth white surface, 15" Punched Edge Ready, 25' roll	P81508A	-	\$259.99	Signarama Freehold
276	Perforated Window Film, Vector, 50/50, VF4002, 50' punched roll, white perforated with black removable adhesive, 50% Print Area, 50% Open Area with 1mil poly liner, durable up to 2-year exterior on window only, 15" Punched Edge Ready	VF40025433	54" x 33'	\$229.99	Signarama Freehold
277	Vector V7841-S, Reflective Conspicuity Tape, 6" red, 6" white, 2" x 50 yards	V7841-S	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
278	Edge Seal Pen, Seal it	-	-	\$15.99	Signarama Freehold

BC #22003 - PURCHASE & DELIVERY OF SIGN MATERIALS**CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/12/2022 - 2/11/2024**

#	DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS	BRAND / I.D.	PACKAGING	PRICE	VENDOR
279	MBX Vinyl Zapper Replacement Wheels, #USZU-010 (pneumatic)	VSZU-010	-	\$49.99	Signarama Freehold
280	MSG45-4PA 150 52" Wide White (UV polycarbonate reel stock)	MSG47-4	-	\$29.99	Signarama Freehold
281	3M RELF Light Blue, Series 823i, 15" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
282	3M RELF Green, Series 823i, 15" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
283	GSP Permagrip White, 15" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
284	Mag 30ml White, 24" x 50'	-	-	NO BID	-
285	Convex Gearwrp 4ml Clear, 15" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
286	Convex Gearwrp 4ml White, 30" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
287	Convex Gearwrp IJWHT, 30" x 50 yards	-	-	NO BID	-
288	Safety Ruler, 52"	-	-	\$129.99	Signarama Freehold
289	K18 Blue Grip on Knife	-	-	\$12.99	Signarama Freehold
290	K18 Black Grip on Knife	-	-	NO BID	-
291	En-Vision 45 Degree Knife Blade	-	-	NO BID	-
292	Hiker #2 Grommet Die Set	-	-	NO BID	-