

PRELIMINARY RESULTS								Mocean Hollow Metal and Hardware, Inc. 999 Airport Road, Unit 2 Lakewood, NJ 08701
BC #22028-2 - PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS DOORS								
OPEN: 2/14/2023 11:00AM								
FRAMES - HOLLOW METAL - KNOCK DOWN								
#	SIZE (W x H)	HAND	ELEVATION TYPE	THICKNESS	GAUGE	JAMB DEPTH	PROFILE	UNIT PRICE
1	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	FS	1-3/4"	16	5-7/8"	DW	\$160.00
2	6' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	FS	1-3/4"	16	5-7/8"	DW	\$190.00
3	2' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	FS	1-3/4"	16	5-7/8"	DW	\$160.00
4	3' 0" x 7' 0"	NH	FS	0	16	5-7/8"	DW-CO	\$160.00
5	6' 0" x 7' 0"	NH	FS	0	16	5-7/8"	DW-CO	\$190.00
6	2' 0" x 7' 0"	NH	FS	0	16	5-7/8"	DW-CO	\$160.00
7	Labor Rate for Reinforcement & Preparations for Hardware							NO BID
FRAMES - LEVEL 4 BALLISTICS								
#	SIZE (W x H)	HAND	ELEVATION TYPE	THICKNESS	GAUGE	JAMB DEPTH	PROFILE	UNIT PRICE
8	6' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	3F	1-3/4"	14	7-3/8"	BG4	NO BID
9	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	TR	1-3/4"	14	6"	BG4	NO BID
10	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	3F	1-3/4"	14	7-3/8"	BG4	NO BID
11	Labor Rate for Reinforcement & Preparations for Hardware							NO BID
WOOD DOORS - FLUSH WOOD - STANDARD								
SPECIES: RNB BIRCH - NATURAL, ROTARY								
#	SIZE (W x H)	HAND	TYPE	SERIES	FINISH		UNIT PRICE	
12	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	F	Premium	Medium Brown		\$575.00	
13	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	HG	Premium	Medium Brown		\$965.00	
14	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	FNV1	Premium	Medium Brown		\$900.00	
WOOD DOORS - LEVEL 4 BALLISTICS								
SPECIES: RNB BIRCH - NATURAL, ROTARY								
#	SIZE (W X H)	HAND	TYPE	SERIES	FINISH		UNIT PRICE	
15	3' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	F	Premium	Medium Brown		NO BID	
16	2' 0" x 7' 0"	LH/RH	F	Premium	Medium Brown		NO BID	
HARDWARE								
#	HARDWARE TYPE			DESCRIPTION			UNIT PRICE	
17	Continuous Hinge			780-112HD 83", US26D, (HI-1) Hager			\$170.00	
18	Asylum or Institutional Lock			AUR 8830-2FL, 630, (LO-1) Yale			\$500.00	

PRELIMINARY RESULTS**BC #22028-2 - PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS DOORS****OPEN: 2/14/2023 11:00AM**Mocean Hollow Metal and
Hardware, Inc.
999 Airport Road, Unit 2
Lakewood, NJ 08701

19	Hinge	BB1279 4-1/2" x 4 1/2", US26D, (HI-1) Hager	\$7.00
20	Entry Lock	AU 5407LN, 626, (LO-3) Yale	\$320.00
21	Electric Strike	1006, 630, (ES-1)HES	\$495.00
22	Surface Closer	3501, 689, (CL-1) Yale	\$160.00
23	Wall Stop	236W, US32D, (ST-1) Hager	\$4.00
24	Silencer	307D, (SI-1) Hager	NO CHARGE
25	Surface Vert Rod Exit	7110 P AU626F, 630, (ED-1) Yale	\$1,780.00
26	Electric Power Transfer	PT1000 2 WIRE, S2, (EA-1) Architectural Builders Hardware	\$320.00
27	Controller	782, (PS-1) Yale	\$680.00
28	Utility, Asylum or Institutional Lock	AU 5430LN, 626, (LO-4) Yale	\$380.00
29	Classroom Lock	AU5408LN, 626, (LO-5) Yale	\$320.00